
 
BD-0409-06/TRJ 

 
SUBMIT BIDS TO: 
 

Seminole County 
1101 E. 1st Street, Room 3208 

Sanford, Florida 32771 
 

Attn:  PURCHASING DIVISION 
 

 

 
INVITATION TO 

BID 
 

and 
Bidder Acknowledgment 

 
Contact:  Timothy Jecks 
  407-665-7129 

tjecks@seminolecountyfl.gov 

 

BID No.:  BD-0409-06/TRJ  

 Mezzanine for the Fire Training Center  

Mandatory Pre-bid Date:  
December 13, 2005 at 10:00 a.m. 
 
Location: 203 Valentine Way, (off SR 419)  
  Longwood, Florida 32750 

Submittal Due Date: January 04, 2006 
Submittal Due Time: 2:00 P.M. 
 
Location: 1101 E. 1st Street, Room 3208  
  Sanford, Florida 32771 

Bidder Name: Federal Employer ID Number or SS Number: 

Mailing Address: 
If returning as a “No Bid”, state reason (if so, return only this 
page): 

City, State, Zip:  
 
Type of Entity:   (Circle one) 
 
 Corporation Partnership Proprietorship 

 
Joint Venture 

 
 
 

X ____________________________________________ 
Authorized Signature (Manual) 

Incorporated in the State of:  

Telephone Number: Printed Name: 

Fax Number: Title: 

Point of Contact email: Date: 
 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID 
 
 

 
 

 
TERM AND CONDITIONS 

 

 

 
CONTACT:  All prospective Bidders are hereby 
instructed not to contact any member of the Seminole 
County Board of County Commissioners, County 
Manager, or Seminole County Staff member other than 
the noted contact person regarding this Invitation to Bid 
or their Bid at any time prior to the posting on the Web 
Site of the final evaluation and recommended ranking by 
County staff for this project.  Any such contact shall be 

cause for rejection of your submittal. 
 
PUBLIC OPENING:  Bids shall be received at the 
Purchasing Division at the above referenced address by 
the specified time and date.  As soon as possible 
thereafter the names of the Bidders shall be read off at 
the specified location.  Persons with disabilities needing 
assistance to participate in the Public Opening should 



call the contact person at least 48 hours in advance of 
the Public Opening at 407-665-7129. 
 
DELAYS: The COUNTY, at its sole discretion, may 
delay the scheduled due dates indicated above if it is to 
the advantage of the COUNTY to do so.  The COUNTY 
will notify Bidders of all changes in scheduled due dates 
by written addendum. 
 
 
RESPONSE SUBMISSION:  The COUNTY will receive 
Bids at the above address.  The outside of the 
envelope/container must be identified with the ITB 
Number and title as stated above.  The 
envelope/container must also include the Bidder’s name 
and return address.   
 
Receipt of the Bids in the Purchasing Division after the 
time and date specified due to failure by the Bidder to 
provide the above information on the outside of the 
envelope/container shall result in the rejection of the Bid. 
 
Bids received after the specified time and date shall be 
returned unopened.  The time and date will be 
scrupulously observed.  The COUNTY will not be 
responsible for late deliveries or delayed mail.  The 
time/date stamp clock located in the Purchasing Division 
shall serve as the official authority to determine lateness 
of any Bid. 
 
The COUNTY cautions Bidders to assure actual delivery 
of mailed or hand-delivered Bids prior to the deadline set 
for receiving Bids.  Telephone confirmation of timely 
receipt of the Bids may be made by calling (407) 665-
7116, before the 2:00 deadline. 
 
Bidders shall submit FIVE (5) COMPLETE SETS (one 
[1] original and four [4] copies) of the submittal, complete 
with all supporting documentation (i.e., photographs, 
drawings, and exhibits) in a sealed envelope/container 
marked as noted above.  The Bidder may submit the 
response in person or by mail. 
 
Bidders may withdraw their Bid by notifying the 
COUNTY in writing at any time prior to the time set for 
the Bid deadline.  Bidders may withdraw their Bid in 
person or through an authorized representative.  Bidders 
and authorized representatives must disclose their 
identity and provide a signed receipt for the Bid.  Bids, 
once opened, become the property of the COUNTY and 
will not be returned to the Bidder. 
 
No additional information may be submitted, or follow-up 
performed by any Bidder after the stated due date. 
 
INQUIRES:  All Bidders shall carefully examine the ITB 
documents.  Any ambiguities or inconsistencies shall be 
brought to the attention of the County Purchasing Office 
in writing prior to the due date; failure to do so, on the 

part of the Bidder, will constitute an acceptance by the 
Bidder of any subsequent decision.  Any questions 
concerning the intent, meaning and interpretations of the 
ITB documents shall be requested in writing and 
received by the County Purchasing Office at least ten 
(10) business days prior to the due date.  Only 
interpretation or correction so given by the Purchasing 
Division, in writing, shall be binding and prospective 
Bidders are advised that no other source is authorized to 
give information concerning, or to explain or interpret the 
Bidding Documents.  Seminole County Purchasing and 
Contracts Telephone Number Division (407) 665-7116; 
Fax Number (407) 665-7956. 
 
ADDENDUM:  The COUNTY will record its responses to 
inquiries and any supplemental instructions submitted to 
the County Purchasing Office prior to the deadline in the 
form of written addendum.  The COUNTY will send 
written addendum to all Bidders who requested the ITB 
directly from the COUNTY’s Purchasing Division.  All 
Bidders should visit the Purchasing website at least five 
(5) calendar days before the date fixed for receiving the 
Bids to ascertain whether any addendum have been 
issued.  Failure to do so could result in rejection of the 
Bid as non-responsive.  The COUNTY shall not be 
responsible for providing said addendum to Bidders who 
receive ITB packages from other sources. 
 
Bidder shall sign, date, and return the latest addendum 
with their Bid.  Previous addenda will be deemed 
received.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to contact the 
COUNTY in the event that a previous addendum is not 
received. 
 
Addenda information will be posted at 
http://www.seminolecountyfl.gov/purchasing. 
 
BIDDER REGISTRATION:  Bidders who obtain ITB 
documents from other sources must officially register 
with the COUNTY’s Purchasing Division in order to be 
placed on the mailing list for any forthcoming addendum 
or other official communications.  Failure to register as a 
Bidder may cause your Bid to be rejected as non-
responsive if you have failed to submit a Bid without an 
addendum acknowledgment for the most current 
addendum. 
 
SELECTION PROCESS: The selection process may 
involve background checks.  To be considered for 
award, a Bid must comply in all specifications. 
 
BID FORM: The Bid Form is included in the Bid 
Documents.  Bid Form must be completed in ink or by 
typewriter.  Bidders are required to bid their prices on the 
Bid Forms supplied by the County in the Bid Documents.   
 
The Bid shall contain an acknowledgement of receipt of 
all Addenda (the numbers of which shall be filled on the 
Bid Form).  Bids by Joint Ventures must be executed by 
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each ownership interest in the Joint Venture. 
 
All Bids shall remain firm for ninety (90) days after the 
day of the Bid opening, but COUNTY may, in its sole 
discretion, release any Bid and return the Bid Security 
prior to that date.  Extensions of time when Bids shall 
remain opened beyond the ninety-day period may be 
made only by mutual agreement between Seminole 
County, the Low Bidder, and the Surety, if any, for the 
Low Bidder. 
 
MODIFICATION AND WITHDRAWAL OF BIDS:  Bids 
may be modified or withdrawn by an appropriate 
document duly executed (in the manner that a Bid must 
be executed) and delivered to the place where Bids are 
to be submitted at any time prior to the opening of Bids.  
Withdrawal of a Bid under this subsection will not 
prejudice the rights of Bidder to file a new Bid. 
 
If within 24 hours after the Bids are opened, any Bidder 
files a duly signed written notice with COUNTY, and 
within 48 hours thereafter demonstrates to the 
reasonable satisfaction of the COUNTY that: a) there 
has been a material and substantial mistake in the 
preparation of the Bid; b) the mistake is of such great 
consequence that to enforce the Agreement would be 
unconscionable; and c) the mistake occurred 
notwithstanding the exercise of reasonable care in the 
preparation of the Bid; the Bidder may withdraw its Bid, 
and the Bid Security will be returned provided that the 
COUNTY is not seriously prejudiced, except for the loss 
of its bargain.  Bidder shall not be allowed to correct a 
Bid with a material and substantial mistake.  A Bidder 
withdrawing its Bid under this subsection shall be 
disqualified from further bidding on the Work. 
 
AWARD:  The COUNTY anticipates award to the 
Respondent’s who submits the Bid judged by the 
COUNTY to be the most advantageous. 
 
The Bidder understands that this ITB does not constitute 
an agreement or a contract with the Bidder.  An official 
contract or agreement is not binding until Bids are 
reviewed and accepted by appointed staff, approved by 
the appropriate level of authority within the COUNTY, 
and executed by the parties. 
 
The COUNTY reserves the right to reject all Bids, to 
waive any formalities, and to solicit and re-advertise for 
new Bids, or to abandon the project in its entirety. 
 
AWARD CRITERIA: The recommendation of award will 
be based on, but not limited to, the following criteria: 
 
• The character, integrity, reputation, judgment and 

efficiency of the Apparent Low Bidder; 
• The past experience furnishing the required 

services; 
• The previous and existing compliance of the 

Apparent Low Bidder in regard to laws and 
ordinances and regulations; 

• The sufficiency of the financial resources and ability 
of the Apparent Low Bidder to perform the Work; 

• Minimum of three (3) consecutive years of 
acceptable experience. 

• Proposed cost to the County. 
 
IMMIGRATIONS AND NATIONALITY ACT (INA) The 
State of Florida will not intentionally award publicly-
funded contracts to any contractor who knowingly 
employs unauthorized alien workers, constituting a 
violation of the employment provisions contained in 8 
U.S.C. Sections 1324a(e) [Section 274A(e) of the 
Immigrations and Nationality Act (“INA”)].  The 
Department shall consider the employment by any 
contractor of unauthorized aliens a violation of Section 
274A(e) of the INA.  Such violation by the Recipient of 
the employment provisions contained in Section 274A(e) 
of the INA shall be grounds for unilateral cancellation of 
this Agreement by the Department. 
 
BID PREPARATION COSTS: Neither the COUNTY nor 
its representatives shall be liable for any expenses 
incurred in connection with preparation of a response to 
this ITB.  Bidders should prepare their Bid simply and 
economically, providing a straightforward and concise 
description of the Bidder’s ability to meet the 
requirements of the ITB documents and/or any other 
requirements as requested by the County. 
 
ACCURACY OF SUBMITTAL INFORMATION: Any 
Bidder which submits in it’s submittal to the COUNTY 
any information which is determined to be substantially 
inaccurate, misleading, exaggerated, or incorrect, shall 
be disqualified from consideration. 
 
INSURANCE:  The awarded Bidder(s) shall maintain 
insurance coverage reflecting the minimum amounts and 
conditions specified herein.  Misrepresentation of any 
material fact, whether intentional or not, regarding the 
Bidder’s insurance coverage, policies or capabilities may 
be grounds for rejection of the submittal and rescission 
of any ensuing contract. 
 
BID SECURITY: Bid Security shall be made payable to 
COUNTY, in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total 
bid amount, in the form of a cashier’s check or a Bid 
Bond issued by a Surety meeting the requirements of 
these Bid Documents.  The Bid Security of the Low 
Bidder shall be retained until such Bidder has executed 
the Agreement, furnished the Insurance Certificates and 
Endorsements.  Bid Security is submitted with the 
understanding that it shall guarantee that the Bidder will 
not withdraw its Bid for a period of at least ninety (90) 
days after the closing time for receipt of Bids.  The 
Surety Companies must be registered and licensed to do 
business within the State of Florida and shall meet the 
minimum acceptance requirements establish by 
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Seminole County. 
 
LEGAL REQUIREMENTS: Bidders are required to 
comply with all provisions of Federal, State, County and 
local laws and ordinances, rules and regulations, that 
are applicable to the items being bid.  Lack of knowledge 
by the Bidder shall in no way be a cause for relief from 
responsibility, or constitute a cognizable defense against 
the legal effect thereof.  
 
POSTING OF ITB AWARD: Recommendation for award 
will be posted for review by interested parties at the 
Purchasing Division and at the County’s Web Page: 
www.seminolecountyfl.gov prior to submission through 
the appropriate approval process and will be posted for a 
period of five (5) working days.  Failure to file protest to 
the Purchasing Manager within the time prescribed in 
the COUNTY’s Purchasing Code, shall constitute a 
waiver of proceedings. 
 
PUBLIC RECORDS:  Upon award recommendation or 
ten (10) days after opening, Bids become “public 
records” and shall be subject to public disclosure 
consistent with Chapter 119, Florida Statutes. Bidders 
must invoke the exemptions to disclosure provided by 
law in the response to the ITB, and must identify the 
data or other materials to be protected, and must state 
the reasons why such exclusion from public disclosure is 
necessary. 
 
ACCEPTANCE/REJECTION:  Seminole County 
reserves the right to accept or reject any or all Bids and 
to make the award to that Bidder, who in the opinion of 
the County will be in the best interest of and/or the most 
advantageous to the County.  Seminole County also 
reserves the right to reject the Bid of any vendor who 
has previously failed in the proper performance of an 
award or to deliver on time contracts of a similar nature 
or who, in the County’s opinion, is not in a position to 
perform properly under this award.  Seminole County 
reserves the right to inspect all facilities of Bidders in 
order to make a determination as to the foregoing.  
Seminole County reserves the right to waive any 
irregularities, informalities, and technicalities and may, at 
its discretion, request a reprocurement. 
 
PROHIBITION AGAINST CONTINGENT FEES: It shall 
be unethical for a person to be retained, or to retain any 
company or person, other than a bonafide employee 
working solely for the CONSULTANT to solicit or secure 
this Agreement and that it has not paid or agreed to pay 
any person, company, corporation, individual or firm, 
other than a bonafide employee working solely for the 
CONSULTANT, any fee, commission, percentage, gift, 
or other consideration contingent upon or resulting from 
award or making of this Agreement.  For the breach or 
violation of this provision, the COUNTY shall have the 
right to terminate the Agreement at its sole discretion, 
without liability and to deduct from the Agreement price, 

or otherwise recover, the full amount of such fee, 
commission, percentage, gift, or consideration. 
 
TAXES:  The County is exempt from Federal Excise and 
State Sales Taxes on direct purchases of tangible 
personal property.  The County's exemption numbers 
are on the face of the purchase order.  If requested, the 
Purchasing Manager will provide an exemption 
certificate to the awarded Bidder. (A copy is included as 
the inside back cover of the Vendor Guide.)  
Vendors/contractors doing business with the County 
shall not be exempted from paying sales tax to their  
suppliers for materials to fulfill contractual obligations 
with the County nor shall any Vendor/Contractor be 
authorized to use the County's Tax Exemption Number 
in securing such materials. 
 
INDEMNIFICATION: The Bidder, without exemption, 
shall indemnify and save harmless, the County, its 
employees and/or any of its Board Members from liability 
of any nature or kind, including cost and expenses for or 
on account of any copyrighted, patent, or invention, 
process, or item manufactured by the Bidder.  Further, if 
such a claim is made, or is pending, the Bidder may, at 
its option and expense, procure for the County the right 
to use, replace or modify the item to render it non-
infringing.  If none of the alternatives are reasonably 
available, the County agrees to return the article on 
request to the Bidder and receive reimbursement.  If the 
Bidder used any design, device, or materials covered by 
letters, patent or copyright, it is mutually agreed and 
understood, without exception, that the bid prices shall 
include all royalties or cost arising from the use of such 
design, device, or materials in any way involved in the 
work.   
 
CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT: The terms, conditions, 
and provisions in this Invitation to Bid shall be merged 
into a Contract.  
 
The State of Florida’s performance and obligation to pay 
under this Agreement is contingent upon an annual 
appropriation by the Legislature, and subject to any 
modification in accordance with Chapter 216, Florida 
Statutes. 
 
If otherwise allowed under this Agreement, extension of 
an Agreement for contractual services shall be in writing 
for a period not to exceed six (6) months and shall be 
subject to the same terms and conditions set forth in the 
initial Agreement.  There shall be only one extension of 
the Agreement unless the failure to meet the criteria set 
forth in the Agreement for completion of the Agreement 
is due to events beyond the control of the Recipient. 
 
SUBCONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT: If the 
Recipient subcontracts any or all of the work required 
under this Agreement, the Recipient agrees to include in 
the subcontract that the subcontractor is bound by the 
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terms and conditions of this Agreement with the 
Department. 
 
AFFIRMATION:  By submission of a Bid, Bidder affirms 
that his/her Bid is made without prior understanding, 
agreement or connection with any corporation, firm, or 
person submitting a Bid for the same materials, supplies, 
equipment or services, and is all respects fair and 
without collusion or fraud.  Bidder agrees to abide by all 
conditions of this Invitation to Bid and the resulting 
contract. 
 
CERTIFIED INSPECTIONS: Bidders must provide a 
certified engineer to inspect and sign off on each 
installation.  This cost must be included in bidders cost. 
 
UNIFORM COMMERCIAL CODE: The Uniform 
Commercial Code (Florida Statues, Chapter 672) shall 
prevail as the basis for contractual obligations between 
the awarded vendor/contractor and Seminole County for 
any terms and conditions not specifically state in this 
Invitation to Bid. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS: The obligations of 
Seminole County under this award are subject to the 
availability of funds lawfully appropriated for its purpose 
by the State of Florida and Board of County 
Commissioners. 
 
AUDIT REQUIREMENTS: The Recipient shall provide 
the Department with an annual financial audit report 
which meets the requirements of Sections 11.45 and 
216.349 Florida Statutes, and Chapter 10.550 and 
10.660, Rules of the Auditor General, for the purposes of 
auditing and monitoring the funds awarded under this 
Agreement. 
 
PROPRIETARY/RESTRICTIVE SPECIFICATIONS: 
Prospective bidders who feel the specifications 
contained herein are proprietary or restrictive in nature, 
thus potentially resulting in reduced competition, must 
contact the Purchasing and Contracts Division upon 
receipt of this Invitation for Bid and prior to bid opening.  
Specifications, which are unrelated to performance, will 
be considered for deletion via addendum to this 
Invitation for Bid. 
 
PAYMENT TERMS/DISCOUNTS: The County’s 
payment terms are in accordance with Florida Statute 
218, Florida Prompt Payment Act.  Cash discounts for 
prompt payment will not be considered in determining 
the lowest net cost for bid evaluation purposes. 
 
CERTIFICATION OF INDEPENDENT PRICE 
DETERMINATION By submission of this bid, the Bidder 

certifies, and in the case of a joint bid each party thereto 
certifies as to its own organization, that in connection 
with this procurement. 

 

 
1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at 

independently, without consultations, collusion, 
communication, or agreement for the purpose of 
restricting competition, as to any matter relating 
to such prices with any other bidder or with any 
competitor. 

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices 
which have been quoted in this bid have not 
been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder and will 
not knowingly be disclosed by the Bidder prior to 
opening, directly  

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by 
the bidder to induce any other person or firm to 
submit or not to submit a bid for the purpose of 
restricting competition. 

 
LICENSES 
A. Vendor to be considered for contract award of 

this Invitation for Bid, shall be either “registered” 
or “certified” by the State of Florida, Department 
of Professional Regulation and licensed by all 
other federal, state, county or municipal 
agencies, which may have jurisdiction over the 
type of work to be performed under this 
solicitation. 

B. Said licenses shall be in the Bidder’s name as it 
appears on the Official Bid Form.  Bidder shall 
supply appropriate license numbers, with 
expiration dates, as part of their bid.  Failure to 
hold and provide proof of proper licensing, 
certification and registration may be grounds for 
rejection of the bid. 

C. Upon notification, Bidder shall provide copies of 
all applicable licenses. 

 
PUBLIC ENTITY LAW:  A person or affiliate who has 
been placed on the convicted vendor list following a 
conviction for a public entity crime may not submit a bid 
on a contract to provide any goods or services to a 
public entity, may not submit a bid on a contract with a 
public entity for the construction or repair or a public 
building or a public work, awarded or perform work as a 
contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consultant under a 
contract with a public entity, and may not transact 
business with any public entity in excess of Category 
Two of the Florida Statute Section 287.017 for a period 
of 36 months from the date of being placed on the 
convicted vendor list. 
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Introduction 
 
The Seminole County Public Safety Department is seeking a vendor experienced in the 
design and fabrication of mezzanines to be responsible for sealed engineering 
drawings, permits and all equipment and personnel necessary to install Mezzanine 
Phase 1, including fire sprinkler system if required by Code, and Mezzanine Lift (Option 
1 if accepted), and Mezzanine Phase 2 (Option 2 if accepted).   
 
 
Description of work: 
 
All measurements must be field verified by contractor. 
 
Mezzanine manufacturer must verify experience in design and fabrication of mezzanines. 
 
Mezzanine structure to be capable of being erected, dismantled, and relocated with hand tools.  
All factory welds are to be certified. 
 
Provide all equipment/personnel necessary to install Mezzanine (phase 1), fire sprinkler system 
under mezzanine if required by code, (Option 1 if accepted) Mezzanine Lift, and (Option 2 if 
accepted) Mezzanine (phase 2) 
 
Contractor to provide sealed engineering drawings as required and obtain permits. 
 
Mezzanine will be used for open storage, items on shelving, garment racks for protective 
clothing and minor fire equipment. Contractor shall include the following information with bid 
package. 

• Design live load of 120 pounds per square foot 
• Deflection under design live load 
• Maximum load on floor when design live load is applied to base plate 

 
Provide AutoCAD version 2005 drawings on CD and printed floor and mezzanine plans with 
submission. 
 
Provide and install Mezzanine: 
 

1. Mezzanine Deck (phase 1) 
• Size:    Approximately 3,250 (46’ x 70) square feet with a VRC installed  

                                   (36 Square Feet) (see option 1 below) 
• Deck:   Shall be prefabricated custom-designed to butt against all walls 
• Clear Height:  90” minimum 
• Deck Height:  Floor surface not less than 108” above floor 
• Deck Construction: Bar Grating 1” x 1/8” bearing bars welded on 1 3/16” centers with  

                                   cross rods 4” on center.  Attached to structure with saddle clips  
                                   and tech screws.  (2 per beam crossed) 

• Design Load:   120 pounds per square foot uniformly distributed 
• Gate:    (1) 6’ Swing type See Option 2 
• Handrail:  All interior areas to include top rail 42” above deck, middle vail and  

                                    kick plate  

 



• Stairway:  Stairway(s) 36” x 11” deep diamond plated treads, combination  
                                    42” H guard/handrail, 36” deep landing.  Located as required by 
                                    OSHA 

• Deck Support:  Mezzanine  shall be free standing 
• Joists:   Open web bar joists 
• Columns:  Structural tubing with footplates and anchored 
• Paint:   Structural steel beams and columns shall be cleaned and sand  

                                    blasted to remove all mill slag, rust, and other debris to assure  
                                    proper adherence of paint to steel.  Paint to be manufacture’s 
                                    two- part baked-on Urethane medium grey or industrial yellow.   
                                    Guard Rail shall be cleaned and painted with two-part baked - on  
                                    Urethane high gloss safety yellow.  Contractor to provide touch- 
                                    up paints from manufacture with MSDS sheets. 

 
Mezzanine support columns must be anchored to the floor.  Gate to be installed directly above 
staging area next to office area 
 
Paint to be manufacture’s two-part baked-on Urethane medium grey or industrial yellow.  Guard 
Rail shall be cleaned and painted with two-part baked-on Urethane high gloss safety yellow.  
Contractor to provide touch-up paints from manufacture with MSDS sheets. 
 
 
 

Option 1: Provide and install Mezzanine Lift (Location to be determined at pre-bid meeting) 
 
2. Enclosed Mezzanine Lift (VRC) 
• Pallet Master model PM-4X4 by Custom Industrial Products, Inc (800-699-2212) 
• Configuration “C” for load/unload 
• Factory pre-wired 
• Installation on West wall with access facing East next to overhead door leading into the 

warehouse area 
• For material/product use only 
• Designed to lift 1000 pounds 
• 4’ X 4’ platform carriage 
• Surface mount ground floor (4” above floor) and flush mount on mezzanine floor 
• Thresholds, upper and lower 
• Ground level loading ramp 
• Operator Controls on both levels 
• Meets ANSI/ASME B20.1 safety standards 

 
Option 2:  Provide and install Mezzanine (phase 2) 
• Same construction as phase 1 
• Approximately 500 Square Feet (16.5 x 30) gate to be placed facing west wall 

(Overhead Door) 
• Relocate stairs for best utilization 
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Minimum qualifications: 
 
• Character, integrity, reputation, judgment and efficiency; 
• Past experience furnishing the required services; 
• Previous and existing compliance of laws and ordinances and regulations; 
• Sufficiency of financial resources and ability to perform the Work; 
• Minimum of three (3) consecutive years of acceptable experience. 
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BID FORM  
BD-0409-06/TRJ 

 
Mezzanine for the Fire Training Center 

 
Name of Bidder: ________________________________________________________ 
 
Mailing Address: ________________________________________________________ 
 
Street Address: _________________________________________________________ 
 
City/State/Zip: __________________________________________________________ 
 
Phone Number: (_________)_______________________________________________ 
 
Fax Number: (__________) ________________________________________________ 
 
License:     Type: ______________________ Number: __________________________ 
 
To: Purchasing Division of Seminole County, Florida 
 
 
 Pursuant to and in compliance with your notice inviting sealed Bids (Invitation to Bid), Instruction to 
Bidders, and the other documents relating thereto, the undersigned Bidder, having familiarized himself with the 
services to be provided to the County, local conditions affecting the performance of the Work, and the cost of 
the Work, hereby proposes and agrees to perform the services, including transportation fleet, drivers, and all 
necessary equipment as required in connection with BD-0409-06/TRJ, including Addenda Nos. 
__________________ through __________________, on file at the Purchasing Division for the Total Bid 
hereinafter set forth.  Bidder acknowledges that it has read and fully understands all Sections of the BD-0409-
06/TRJ. 
 
 The undersigned, as Bidder, declares that the only persons or parties interested in this Bid as 
principals, are those named herein; that this proposal is made without collusion with any person, firm or 
corporation; and he proposes and agrees, if the Bid is accepted, that he will execute a Contract with the 
COUNTY; that he will furnish the Bid Security, Insurance Certificates, Endorsements, and Policies, that he is 
aware that failure to properly comply with the requirements set out in the Bid Documents may result in a finding 
that the Bidder is non-responsive and may cause a forfeiture of the Bid Security. 
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BID FORM 
BD-0409-06/TRJ 

 
AGREEMENT TITLE:   Mezzanine for the Fire Training Center 
     
 Pursuant to and in compliance with your Invitation for Bid, the Instructions to Bidders, and other 
documents relating thereto, the undersigned hereby agrees to furnish all labor, Materials and Equipment to do 
the Work in strict accordance with the Contract Documents and all addenda, if any, issued prior to the date of 
this Bid at the Total Bid herein as follows:   
 
The awardee for this project will be determined by the total bid amount including Phase 1 and/or 
Options 1 and/or Option 2, based on availability of funds, and at the sole option of the County. 
 
TOTAL AMOUNT OF MEZZANINE DECK PHASE 1: _________________________________________ 
 Numbers 
 
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ENCLOSED MEZZANINE LIFT (VRC) Option 1: _____________________________ 
 Numbers 
 
TOTAL AMOUNT OF PROVIDE & INSTALL MEZZANINE – PHASE 2 Option 2: _______________________ 
 Numbers 
 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT INCLUDING PHASE 1 AND OPTIONS 1 & 2: _____________________________ 
 Numbers 
________________________________________________________________________________________ 

(IN WORDS) 
 
1. The Bidder acknowledges that the Total Amount of Bid stated above includes compensation for all 

Work, labor, permits, bonds, equipment, materials, and any and all incidental costs necessary for the 
proper execution of the required services.   

 
 
______________________________   _______________________________________ 
(Name of BIDDER)      (Signature of person signing this BID FORM) 
 
        _______________________________________ 
        (Printed name of person signing this BID FORM) 
 
        _______________________________________ 
        (Title of person signing this BID FORM) 
 
ACCOMPANYING THIS BID IS_________________________________________________________ 
(insert the word(s) "cashier's check," bidder's bond," certified check," or other security as provided by law, as 
the case may be) in an amount equal to at least five percent (5%) of the Total Bid, payable to the Board of 
County Commissioners.  The undersigned deposits above-named security as a Bid guarantee and agrees that 
it shall be forfeited to the COUNTY as liquidated damages in case this Bid is accepted by the COUNTY and 
the undersigned fails to execute an Agreement with the COUNTY as specified in the Contract Documents 
accompanied by the required certificates of insurance coverage, and endorsements.  Should the COUNTY be 
required to engage the services of an attorney in connection with the enforcement of this Bid, Bidder promises 
to pay COUNTY's reasonable attorney's fees and costs (including attorney's fees and costs on appeals) 
incurred with or without suit. 
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Bidder Information 

 
 
Bidder shall complete the following information and include with their bid submittal. 
 

 
 

 
 

CONTRACTING 
OFFICER 

 

 
TITLE 

 
OFFICER'S FULL LEGAL NAME 

  
President 
 

 

  
Vice-President 
 

 

  
Secretary 
 

 

  
Treasurer 
 

 

  
Resident 
Superintendent 

 

 
 
Indicate with an asterisk (*) in the first column, which officer will sign the resulting contract.  If other 
than the President, include a copy of the corporate resolution which gives express authority for 
execution of the specific proposal and contract documents.  Each Bidder must assure that the officer 
information provided is in accordance with the Bidder's corporate registration supplied to the 
Secretary of State. 
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CONFLICT OF INTEREST STATEMENT 
 

STATE OF FLORIDA   ) 
      )  ss 
COUNTY OF ____________________ ) 
 
Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared __________________________________________, who 
was duly sworn, deposes, and states: 

1. I am the ___________________________ of __________________________________ with a local office in 
__________________________ and principal office in ______________________.   

2. The above named entity is submitting an Expression of Interest for the Seminole County project described as: 
  
BD-0409-06/TRJ - Mezzanine for the Fire Training Center 

3. The Affiant has made diligent inquiry and provides the information contained in this Affidavit based upon his own 
knowledge. 

4. The Affiant states that only one submittal for the above project is being submitted and that the above named entity 
has no financial interest in other entities submitting Bids for the same project. 

5. Neither the Affiant nor the above named entity has directly or indirectly entered into any agreement, participated 
in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of free competitive pricing in connection with the entity’s 
submittal for the above project.  This statement restricts the discussion of pricing data until the completion of 
negotiations and execution of the Agreement for this project. 

6. Neither the entity nor its affiliates, nor any one associated with them, is presently suspended or otherwise 
ineligible from participating in contract lettings by any local, state, or federal agency. 

7. Neither the entity, nor its affiliates, nor any one associated with them have any potential conflict of interest due to 
any other clients, contracts, or property interests for this project. 

8. I certify that no member of the entity’s ownership, management, or staff has a vested interest in any aspect of or 
Department of Seminole County. 

9. I certify that no member of the entity’s ownership or management is presently applying for an employee position 
or actively seeking an elected position with Seminole County. 

10. In the event that a conflict of interest is identified in the provision of services, I, on behalf of the above named 
entity, will immediately notify Seminole County in writing. 

 
DATED this ___________________ day of ________________________________, 20______. 

 _________________________________________________ 
 (Affiant) 
 _________________________________________________ 
  Typed Name of Affiant 
 _________________________________________________ 
 Title 
 
Sworn to and subscribed before me this ___________ day of ______________________, 20______. 

 
Personally known_____________________________ ________________________________ 
 
OR Produced identification_________  Notary Public - State of ______________________ 
 
_______________________________  My commission expires______________________ 
(Type of identification) 
        _____________________________________ 

(Printed typed or stamped 
commissioned name of notary public) 
 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID



 

 
 

DRAFT AGREEMENT  
SCOPE OF SERVICES 

 
Mezzanine for the Fire Training Center 
________________________________ 
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	TERM AND CONDITIONS 
	AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS: The obligations of Seminole County under this award are subject to the availability of funds lawfully appropriated for its purpose by the State of Florida and Board of County Commissioners. 
	AUDIT REQUIREMENTS: The Recipient shall provide the Department with an annual financial audit report which meets the requirements of Sections 11.45 and 216.349 Florida Statutes, and Chapter 10.550 and 10.660, Rules of the Auditor General, for the purposes of auditing and monitoring the funds awarded under this Agreement. 
	PROPRIETARY/RESTRICTIVE SPECIFICATIONS: Prospective bidders who feel the specifications contained herein are proprietary or restrictive in nature, thus potentially resulting in reduced competition, must contact the Purchasing and Contracts Division upon receipt of this Invitation for Bid and prior to bid opening.  Specifications, which are unrelated to performance, will be considered for deletion via addendum to this Invitation for Bid. 
	PAYMENT TERMS/DISCOUNTS: The County’s payment terms are in accordance with Florida Statute 218, Florida Prompt Payment Act.  Cash discounts for prompt payment will not be considered in determining the lowest net cost for bid evaluation purposes. 
	CERTIFICATION OF INDEPENDENT PRICE DETERMINATION By submission of this bid, the Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid each party thereto certifies as to its own organization, that in connection with this procurement. 
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