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SEMINOLE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
AGENDA MEMORANDUM

SUBJECT: Final Plat Approval for Trails — Unit 2A

DEPARTMENT: Planning & Development DIVISION: Development Review

P

AUTHORIZED BY: Donald S. Fishe®’ CONTACT: Cynthia Sweet (M gxt. 7443

Agenda Date9/28/2004 Regular[ | Consent[X] Work Session [ | Briefing [ ]
Public Hearing ~1:30 [ ] Public Hearing — 7:00 [ ]

MOTION/RECOMMENDATION:

Approve and authorize the Chairman to execute the final plat for Trails — Unit 2A, for
Maronda Homes, Inc. of Florida, Wayne Von Dreele, President, applicant

District 1 — Maloy (Cynthia Sweet) /5

BACKGROUND:

The applicant, Maronda Homes, Inc. of Florida, is requesting approval of the Final Plat
for the Trails — Unit 2A. The plat consists of 41 single family residential lots zoned PUD
(Planned Unit Development) on a 15.138 acre parcel. Each lot is serviced by Florida
Water Services for water and sewer and all internal roads within the development are
public. The site is located on the south side of Snowhill Road and west of Avenue H, in
Chuluota, within The Trails PUD in Section 21, Township 21 S, and Range 32 E.

The plat meets all the applicable conditions of the approved Developer's Commitment
Agreement for The Trails Planned Unit Development, Chapter 35 of the Seminole
County Land Development Code, and Chapter 177, Florida Statutes.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommends approval for the Final Plat of Trails Unit 2A.

District 1 - Maloy
Attachments: Location Map — Exhibit A
Reduced Copy of Plat — Exhibit B

Reviewed by

F 4

File No. cpdd04
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This is fo certify thal the undersignad, MARONDA HOMES,

MNCOF FLUS .
Section 21, Township 21 South, Range 32 East e Sepnion marsan. 523 5 oesas i Sorme 10 L8 srvceds oni s o
- . made in occordonce with sait survey, is hersby adopled as the lrue ond
sSeminole County, Floride

correct plat of sueh lands

The Cwrar in fos simple o7 the iGods Gesceibad in the foregong option 1o
this plot, hareby dedicatos the sieeals 9ng cosemunts [axcept for thosw
noted 95 arivate] shown herzon to the gerpstusl use of the public

RONDA HOMES, INC. OF FLORIDA has
& to he signed and altestes o ar witnessed
wd befow an the doy of oo 2004

DESCRIPTION:

COMMENCE AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF FHE SOUTHEAST 1/4 OF SECTION I1, TOWHSHIP 11 SOUTH, RAMGE 37 LAST. S

FLORDA: THENCE RUN 5.01°50" ALONG THE EAST LINE OF SAIL SQUTHEAST 1% GF SECTION b1, 4 DISTANCE OF o

SOUTH LINE OF NORTH §/4 OF THE SOUTH 172 OF SAID 5§CTAGN 25 THENCE RUN 53604 12W  ALONC Saif SOUTH
A FOINT DN THE WEST RIGHT~OF ~WAY LINE OF AVENUE “H' AS RECORDED M PLAT BDOK 6, PAGE A6 e THE PUBLIC R

SEMINOLE COUNTY, FLORIDA; THENCE CONTINGE S.8910492°W. ALONG AFORESAID SOUTH (INE 1299.33 FEET T0 THE WEST LINE OF

THE SOUTHEAST 1/e OF Smo SECTION 2% THENCE #f ALONG SAID SOUTH LINE 350.41 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINMING:

THEMCE RUN N.00'563 229 00 FEET, THENCE raer THENCE RUN MOOZ9I8° W. 16501 FEET, THENCE RuN By

N1B'5897W. 78.97 :as' THENCE RUN N.00°28°18" B UTH RIGHT=~OF ~®AY LINE OF SMOW MILL ROAD; THENCE RUN Neme: Wayne Ven Or

58903 IIW. ALANG SAID SOUTH RICHT-QF ~WAY LINE ao @0 . TMEHCE AUN HB9°0USS™W 54018 FEET, TMENCE AUN & 8903 31" Meme: Wayne Von Dres

$82.47 FEETTHENCE RUN S 91BBIE 58072 F RESAD SOUTH LINE OF THE NORTH 174 OF THE S0UTH 1/ OF SECTION

21, TOWNSHIE 21 SOUTH, RANGE 32 EAST, THEMCE RUN N.3°03'30°T, ALONG SAID SOUTH LINE 1161.85 FEET TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING

OF FLORIDA, g Florida Corgaration

President

HTAENG 15 138 ACFES MORE QR L

PN NI snmmsrsmssmmene. FTIRT MO oo

STATE OF FLORIDA COUNTY OF SEMINCLE
The foregaing instrument wos ocknowiedgsd belors me this____ doy
of 2004, by Wayne Yon Dresle who is the Fresident of

CARBNER HOMES, INC. OF FLORIDA, o Florida Corgoration, on behatf
af said cerperation. He [ ] s personally knewn te me or [ ] hos
produced o valig driver’s license as identification

SHOWN HEREON ARE TQ BE SET IN ACCORDANCE @iTH CHAR

ER I77.081(9) FLORIDA STATUTES, Signature of Person Taking Acknowledgement
TENTION AREA) SHALL BE OWNED anD MAMTAINED 8Y TRAILS NOMEQWNERS ASSOCIATION, ING

EMENT SHOWN HEREON IS WERERY DEDICATED T AND SMALL BE MAINTANED T TRAILS HOMEQWNERS
INC. FOR MAINTENANCE OF THE COMMON SUBOIVISION WaLl.

Print Ngme

Sarial Mo, {if ony} . Commission Expires:

4. THE SEMINOLE COUNTY DEVELOPMENT ORDER §99-565 AFFECTS THE ENTIRE PLATTED PARCEL
LL LOTS SND TRACTS ARE SUBJECT 70 4 10" SIDEWALK & UTHLITY SEMENT (DEDICATED TO SEMINOLE COUNTY) COUNTY SURVEYOR'S CERTIFICATE

CIACENT T STREET RIGHT~OF~WAYS EXCERT AS OTHERWISE SHOWN HERE

6. QIRECT/ DRIVEWAY ACCESS TO SNOW MILL ROAD FROM LOTS 3 THROUGH 16 IS PROMIBITED, I have reviewad this plat and find it to be in conformity with

Chapter 177 Florica Stotutes.

7. TRACY ‘BT {(DRAINAGE & UTIITY EASEMENT) SHALL BE OWNED AND MAINTAINED BY TRAILS HOMEOWNERS ASSOGIATION, (NC.
#ITH A DRAMAGE EASEMENT DEDICATED TO SEMINOLE COUNTY

8. BEARINGS ARE BASED ON THE SOUTH LINE OF THE MORTH 1/4 OF THE SOUTH 1/2 DF SECTION 21-21-32 AS SEING N.89°01 30,
PER PLAT OF TRAILS-UNIT !_ PLAT BOOK £2. PAGES 88-64, SEMINOLE COUNTY, FLORIDA. o1 LW

A;;Mr_NTS SH. AL50 BE EASEMENTS FOR THE CONSTRUCTION, INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND OPE:’?AT'QN ;,‘Vi; "p e s

EVISION >Ek‘/ms . PROVIDED WOWEVER, NG SUCH CONSTRUCTION, rNsmLfAr ON, MAINTENANCE AND OPER- aride Registration urnbe N

ATION OF CASLE TEL fvlsu) RVICES SHALL INTERFERE WITH THE FACILITIES An VICES OF AN ELECTRIC, TELEPHONE, Lounty Surveyar for Seminole County, Fiarida,

GAS OR OTWER PUBLIC UTILITY. THIS NQTE SHaLL NOT APPLY TO THOSE PRIVATE ;ASEMENTS GRANTED TC OR QBTAINED

BY A PARTICULAR >lE"T.’\’lC, TELEPHONE, $A5 OR OTHER PUBLIC UTILITY, Dat

s

v

CERTIFICATE OF PREPARING SURVEYOR

This plat was prepared under my direction and supervision. This
plot complies with off the survey requirements of Chapler !

Flariga Statgtes,
Ja& 27 2904-

Surveyor's Signoture
MARK [ LUKE
Surveyar's Mome {prinled)

HENRICH=-LUKE & SWAGGERTY, Li

Tegal Entity's Home
L.B 7278

tegal Entity’s Certiticate of Authoriziation Nimber

230 S, RONALD REAGAN BLVD. SUITE 114, LONGWOOD, Fl 32750
Legal Entity's Address

’ T
[ QE GENE VA
<3 g CERTIFICATE OF APPROVAL
57
5y g\ BY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
: i H THIS 5 TO CERTIFY, Thot on the
sire | I foregeing plat was opproved by the Board of County

o BRUMLEY A0AD Commissioners of Seminofe County, Florida.

Chairman af the Soard

| Attest
“ Clerk of the Board
i BY o0.C
o 1 |
" ocarion uap | | CERTIFICATE OF CLERK OF CIRCUIT COURT

NOT 7D BCALE | MEREBY CERYIFY, Thal I hove sxamined the Foreqeing piat ond
complies wilh all the raquiremants of Chapter 177,
and was fied for cecord on

E N —

NOTICE: This plat, as recorded in ila graphic form, ia Lhe

-1

SWAGGER : afficiel depiction of the subdivided lands deserihed herein ot Fite Mo
survayors & moppers and will in no circumstances be supplanted in authority

by any other graphic or digital form of the plal. Thers
may be additional restrictions that are not recorded on
this plat that may be found tn the public records of this
county

250 5. Rgnots wmm E

QF THE SOQURT
in and for Seminole County.Flarida,

64z
Lconed Simmans
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NOTICE: This plat, as recorded in jis graphic form. is the
official depiction of the subdivided lands described herein
and will in no eircumslances be suppianted in suthority
by any other graphic or digital form of the plat. There

r b y Ty ~
ot b . A 4 L —e
ast may be additional restrictions that are not recorded on

Section 21, T OW n ‘:»hlp\ 21 South, R‘a nge . Lhis plat that may be found in the sublic records of this
seminole County, Florida county
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