TERM CONTRACTS

28.

Approve Amendment #1 to IFB-3056-03/JVP - Term Contract for the
Purchase of Water Meter Boxes and Covers, with National
Waterworks, Orlando (Price Increase) (Term Contract).

IFB-3056-03/JVP provides for all necessary labor, materials, equipment,
transportation, coordination and incidentals necessary to provide water
meter boxes and covers to be used by Environmental Services/Water &
Wastewater Division on multiple projects throughout the County.

Amendment #1 will provide for a price increase due to the escalations in
costs associated with the materials of the waterworks industry. The
current Contractor, National Waterworks, Orlando requested an increase
for all contracted items. Based on a current Market Survey, the proposed
costs with the exception of three line items were found to be competitive
and reasonable. These three line items are not considered to be
reasonable, and therefore these items will be obtained through another
vendor. The list of products and the market survey information are
included as part of the backup documents.

Environmental Services /Waste & Wastewater Division and Fiscal
Services/Purchasing and Contracts Division recommend the Board to
approve the amendment and authorize the County Manager to execute
the amendment as approved and prepared by the County Attorney’s
Office.



FIRST AMENDMENT TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR WATER METER BOXES AND COVERS
(IFB-3056-02/JVP)

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT is made and entered into this day of

, 20 and 1is to that certain Agreement made and

entered into on the 21°® day of February, 2003, between NATIONAL
WATERWORKS, INC., whose address is 1820 Metcalf Avenue, Thomasville,
Georgia 31792, hereinafter referred to as “CONTRACTOR” and SEMINOLE
COUNTY, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address
is Seminole County Services Building, 1101 East First Street, Sanford,
Florida 32771, hereinafter referred to as “COUNTY”.

WITNESU SET H:

WHEREAS, the CONTRACTOR and COUNTY entered into the above-referen-
ced Agreement on February 21, 2003 for purchase of water meter boxes and
covers; and

WHEREAS, the parties desire to amend the Agreement so as to enable
both parties to continue to enjoy the mutual benefits it provides; and

WHEREAS, Section 21 of the Agreement provides that any amendments
shall be wvalid only when expressed in writing and duly signed by the
parties,

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual understandings and

agreements contained herein, the parties agree to amend the Agreement as

follows:

1. Section 5 of the Agreement is amended to read:

SECTION 5. COMPENSATION. The COUNTY agrees to compensate the
CONTRACTOR for the professional services called for under this Agreement
on a “Fixed Fee” basis. When a Purchase Order is issued for a “Fixed
Fee” basis, then the applicable Purchase Order Fixed Fee amount shall
include any and all reimbursable expenses. The total annual compensation
pavable to all CONTRACTORS under IFB-3056-02/JVP shall not exceed the

annual sum budgeted by the COUNTY for purchase of water meter boxes and



covers.
2. Fxhibit “A” of the Agreement is amended by the addition of
Fxhibit “A”, attached, with price increases for items listed thereon.
3. Except as herein modified, all terms and conditions of the

Agreement shall remain in full force and effect for the term of the

Agreement, as originally set forth in said Agreement.
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this

instrument for the purpose herein expressed.

NATIONAL WATERWORKS, INC.

ATTEST:
By:
SAM A. ETHERIDGE, Branch Manager
(CORPORATE SEAL) Date:
WITNESSES: SEMINOLE COUNTY, FLORIDA

By:

J. KEVIN GRACE, County Manager

Date:

Within authority of Resolution
No. 93-R-71 adopted February 23,
1993.

For the use and reliance
of Seminole County only.

Approved as to form and
legal sufficiency.

County Attorney
AC/1pk

8/19/05
lam-1fb-3056

Attachment:
Exhibit “A” - Price List



IFB-3056-03/JVP
Term Contract for Water Meter Boxes and Covers
National Waterworks

Amendment #1
Contract Prices Revised Prices
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. | UM Amendment #1
QTY. (2/21/03-9/13/05) (9/13/05-2/20/08)
1 3/4:” Single Concrete/Polymer 300 | Each $46.85 $51.35
Fiberglass box and cover (complete) item deleted from
contract
1a Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 500 | Each $18.45 $20.30
' Cast Iron Reader for above box
ib Cast iron Traffic Cover for above box 25 | Each $17.90 $19.69
2 34 Double Concrete/Polymer 2,000 | Each $57.35 $63-08
Fiberglass reinforced box and cover item deleted from
(complete) contract
2a Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 750 | Each $24.20 $26.62
Cast Iron Reader for above box
2b Cast iron traffic cover for above box 25 | Each $24.20 $26.62
3 3/4" Double Polyethylene Box and | 2500 | Each $59.90 $65.89
cover (complete)
3a Cover only : Ductile Iron with Ductile 500 | Each $26.50 $29.15
Iron Reader for above box
4 1* Single Concrete/Polymer 1,000 | Each $46.75 $51.43
Fiberglass box and cover (complete) Iltem deleted from
contract
4a Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 350 | Each $18.45 $20.30
Cast Iron Reader for above box
4b Cast Iron Traffic Cover for above box 25 | Each $17.90 $19.69
5 1" Single Polyethylene box and cover | 1500 Each $46.80 $51.48
(complete)
5a Cover only : Ductile Iron with Ductile 350 | Each $22.50 $24.75
iron Reader for above box
6 2 Single Concrete/Polymer 75 | Each $97.90 $107.69
Fiberglass box and cover (complete).
6a Cover Oly Concrete/Polymer with 35 Each $45.25 $49.76
Cast Iron Reader for above box
6b Cast lron Traffic Cover for above box 15 Each $44.25 $48.68
7 2" Single Polyethylene box and cover | 100 Each $89.00 $97.90
(complete) .
Ta Cover Only: Ductile Iron with Ductile 15 Each $50.50 ‘ $55.55
Iron Reader for above box




MARKET SURVEY FOR

METER BOXES AND RELATED ITEMS (CDR BRAND OR EQUAL)

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. UM National Ferguson Hughes
QTY. Waterworks | Waterworks Supply
Proposed (offering
Increase Armorcast)
1 3/4" Single Concrete/Polymer 300 Each | $51.35 $ 34.00 $70.00
Fiberglass box and cover (complete)
la Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 500 Each | $20.30 $26.00 $30.00
Cast Iron Reader for above box
1b Cast iron Traffic Cover for above 25 Each | $19.69 $26.00 $27.00
box
2 3/4" Double Concrete/Polymer 2,000 Each | $63.09 $44.00 $100.00
Fiberglass reinforced box and cover
(complete)
2a Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 750 Each | $26.62 $34.00 $37.00
Cast Iron Reader for above box
2b Cast iron traffic cover for above box 25 Each | $26.62 $34.00 $37.00
3 3/4" Double Polyethylene Box and 2500 | Each | $65.89 $92.50 NO BID
cover (complete)
3a | Cover only : Ductile Iron with 500 Each | $29.15 $45.65 NOBID
Ductile Iron Reader for above box
4 1" Single Concrete/Polymer 1000 | Each | $51.43 $34.00 $69.00
Fiberglass box and cover (complete)
4a Cover only Concrete/Polymer with 350 Each | $20.30 $26.00 $29.00
Cast Iron Reader for above box
4b Cast Iron Traffic Cover for above 25 Each | $19.69 $26.00 $21.00
box
5 1" Single Polyethylene box and cover 1500 | Each | $51.48 $72.50 NO BID
(complete)
S5a Cover only : Ductile Iron with 350 Each | $24.75 $36.50 NO BID
Ductile Iron Reader for above box
6 27 Single Concrete/Polymer 75 Each | $107.69 $129.00 $121.00
Fiberglass box and cover (complete).
6a Cover Oly Concrete/Polymer with 35 Each | $49.76 $62.00 $41.00
Cast Iron Reader for above box
6b Cast Iron Traffic Cover for above 15 Each | $48.68 $65.00 $60.00
box
7 2” Single Polyethylene box and 100 Each | $97.90 $137.50 NO BID
cover (complete)
7a Cover Only: Ductile Iron with 15 Each | $55.55 $81.25 NO BID
Ductile Iron Reader for above box




