

TERM CONTRACTS

- 17. Approve Amendment #1 to IFB-3086-04/GMG – Term Contract for the Purchase of Aluminum Posts and Related Hardware and Components, with Vulcan Signs, Inc., Foley, Alabama (Price Increase) (Term Contract).**

IFB-3086-04/GMG provides for the purchase of aluminum sign blanks, posts and related hardware and components for the County Sign Shop. Amendment #1 will provide for a price increase due to Manufacturer's increase. A market research was conducted and it was determined that the proposed price is in accordance with current market costs. The revised Exhibit A - Scope of Services and Price Schedule have been revised to reflect the proposed increase.

Public Works Department/Traffic Engineering Division and Fiscal Services/Purchasing and Contracts Division recommend the Board to approve the amendment and authorize the Purchasing and Contracts Manager to execute the amendment.

**FIRST AMENDMENT TO AGREEMENT FOR PURCHASE OF ALUMINUM POSTS AND RELATED
HARDWARE AND COMPONENTS (IFB-3086-04/GMG)**

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT is made and entered into this _____ day of _____, 20____ and is to that certain Agreement made and entered into on the 24th day of May, 2004, between **VULCAN SIGNS**, whose mailing address is P.O. Box 1850, Foley, Alabama 36536, hereinafter referred to as "CONTRACTOR", and **SEMINOLE COUNTY**, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is Seminole County Services Building, 1101 East First Street, Sanford, Florida 32771, hereinafter referred to as "COUNTY".

W I T N E S S E T H:

WHEREAS, the CONTRACTOR and COUNTY entered into the above-referenced Agreement on May 24, 2004 for purchase of aluminum posts and related hardware and components; and

WHEREAS, the parties desire to amend the Agreement so as to enable both parties to continue to enjoy the mutual benefits it provides; and

WHEREAS, Section 21 of the Agreement provides that any amendments shall be valid only when expressed in writing and duly signed by the parties,

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual understandings and agreements contained herein, the parties agree to amend the Agreement as follows:

1. Exhibit "A" of the Agreement is deleted and Exhibit "A", attached hereto, is substituted therefore.

2. Except as herein modified, all terms and conditions of the Agreement shall remain in full force and effect for the term of the Agreement, as originally set forth in said Agreement.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument for the purpose herein expressed.

VULCAN SIGNS

Witness

Print Name

Witness

Print Name

By: _____

Print Name

Title: _____

Date: _____

SEMINOLE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Witness

Print Name

Witness

Print Name

By: _____
BETSY COHEN, Purchasing Supervisor

Date: _____

As authorized by Section 330.3,
Seminole County Administrative
Code.

For the use and reliance
of Seminole County only.

Approved as to form and
legal sufficiency.

County Attorney

AC/lpk

7/12/06

ifb-3086 1am

Attachment:

Exhibit "A" - Scope of Services

Vulcan Signs

408 East Berry Avenue / P.O. Box 1850 Foley, Alabama / 36536-1850 (251)-943-1541 or 1-800-633-6845

BID #IFB-3086-04/GMG

TO: ATTN: GLORIA GARCIA
SEMINOLE COUNTY, FL

DATE: 6/30/2006

In response to your inquiry we are pleased to quote on furnishing the following:

ITEM	QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
		GROUP - I - HARDWARE		\$0.00
* 1	125	BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES - WHITE	24.14	3,017.50
* 2	125	BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES - YELLOW	24.14	3,017.50
* 3	125	FLEX STAKE - WHITE	18.58	2,322.50
* 4	125	FLEX STAKE - YELLOW	18.58	2,322.50
5	150	CHEVRON BRACKET - CAB 2	18.60	2,790.00
6	300	TWIST BRACKET - VS-TWIST 9"	5.95	1,785.00
7	1000	UNDERGROUND BRACKET	NO BID	
8	100	CANTILEVER - VS-800 METRO	18.56	1,856.00
9	50	SQUARE BASE	NO BID	
10	50	SQUARE POST - 12' X 2 1/4"	\$ 40.33	5,538.00
11	200	14' - 2.5# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	27.69	18,990.00
12	1000	12' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	18.99	18,990.00
13	100	10' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	15.82	1,582.00
14	200	8' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	12.66	2,532.00
15	300	6' - 1.12# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	5.97	1,791.00
16	500	REFLECTORS, AMBER 3 1/4"	0.42	210.00
17	1000	REFLECTORS, RED 3 1/4"	0.42	420.00
*		ITEMS 1 & 2 - SAFE HIT #SH148SMA		
*		ITEMS 1 & 2 - SAFE HIT #SH148SMA		
			TOTAL	\$67,164.00

Prices are F.O.B.: DESTINATION

Delivery: STOCK ITEMS 3-5 DAYS ARO, NON STANDARD ITEMS 30 DAYS ARO

Terms: NET 30



408 East Berry Avenue / P.O. Box 1850 Foley, Alabama / 36536-1850 (251)-943-1541 or 1-800-633-6845

BID # IFB - 3086-04/GMG

TO: ATTN: GLORIA GARCIA
SEMINOLE COUNTY, FL

DATE: 6/30/2006

In response to your inquiry we are pleased to quote on furnishing the following:

[illegible]

Prices are F.O.B.:	DESTINATION
Delivery:	30 DAYS ARO
Terms:	NET 30

EXHIBIT A
VULCAN SIGNS PROPOSED PRICE INCREASE (JUNE 30, 2006)
IFB-3086-04/GMG

GROUP #1 (HARDWARE)							
DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UNIT	Current PRICE	Proposed Price	Percentage Increase	QTY	TOTAL
BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES	4'	EA	\$ 24.14			125	
BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES	4'	EA	\$ 24.14			125	
FLEX STAKE WHITE	4'	EA	\$ 18.58			125	
FLEX STAKE YELLOW	4'	EA	\$ 18.58			125	
CHEVRON BRACKET	18"X24"	SET	\$ 18.60			150	
TWIST BRACKET	24"	EA	\$ 5.95			300	
UNDERGROUND BRACKET	2"X5"	EA				1000	
CANTILEVER	24"	EA	\$ 15.70	\$ 18.56	\$ (0.15)	100	
SQUARE BASE	2 1/4"	EA				50	
SQUARE POST	2 1/4"	EA	\$ 40.33			50	
U-CHANNEL 2.5LB PER FT	14'	EA	\$ 22.33	\$ 27.69	\$ (0.19)	200	
U-CHANNEL 2 LB PER FT	12'	EA	\$ 15.31	\$ 18.99	\$ (0.19)	1000	
U-CHANNEL 2 LB PER FT	10'	EA	\$ 12.76	\$ 15.82	\$ (0.19)	100	
U-CHANNEL 2 LB PER FT	8'	EA	\$ 10.21	\$ 12.66	\$ (0.19)	200	
U-CHANNEL 1.12 LB PER FT	6'	EA	\$ 4.82	\$ 5.97	\$ (0.19)	300	
REFLECTORS, AMBER	4" RND	EA	\$ 0.42			500	
REFLECTORS, RED	4" RND	EA	\$ 0.42			1000	

GROUP #4 (ALUMINUM PREFACED WITH 3M SIGN FACES)							
Stop signs MUTCD punched; Street Ids special punch							
DESCRIPTION	SIZE	UNIT	Current PRICE	Proposed Price	Percentage Increase	QTY	TOTAL
STOP (ENG)	30"X30"	EA	\$ 15.91	\$ 19.97	\$ (0.20)	25	
STOP (HI)	30"X30"	EA	\$ 21.14	\$ 25.20	\$ (0.16)	1000	
STOP (DIAMOND)	30"X30"	EA	\$ 39.31	\$ 45.07	\$ (0.13)	50	
STREET IDS WHITE (HI)	24"X9"	EA	\$ 5.20	\$ 6.21	\$ (0.16)	300	
STREET IDS WHITE (DIAMOND)	24"X9"	EA	\$ 9.56	\$ 11.76	\$ (0.19)	50	
STREET IDS WHITE (HI)	30"X9"	EA	\$ 6.51	\$ 7.77	\$ (0.16)	300	
STREET IDS WHITE (DIAMOND)	30"X9"	EA	\$ 12.00	\$ 14.69	\$ (0.18)	50	
STREET IDS WHITE (HI)	36"X9"	EA	\$ 7.81	\$ 9.32	\$ (0.16)	300	
STREET IDS WHITE (DIAMOND)	36"X9"	EA	\$ 14.41	\$ 17.61	\$ (0.18)	50	
STREET IDS WHITE (HI)	42"X9"	EA	\$ 9.13	\$ 10.88	\$ (0.16)	300	
STREET IDS WHITE (DIAMOND)	42"X9"	EA	\$ 16.82	\$ 20.57	\$ (0.18)	50	

Vulcan Signs

A PART OF Vulcan, Inc.



P.O. Box 1850 • 408 East Berry Avenue • Foley, Alabama 36536-1850
251.943.1541 • FAX 251.943.1544 • E-mail: vulcan3@vulcaninc.com • Web Site: www.vulcaninc.com

June 30, 2006

Seminole County, FL
1101 E. 1st Street, Room 3208
Sanford, FL 32771

ATTN: Gloria Garcia

Re: Sealed Bid IFB-3086-04/GMG

Dear Gloria:

In lieu of recent increases in aluminum and steel, we are unable to continue to honor the prices of the original prices of the above contract. We would like to exercise the escalation as allowed by the contract. The enclosed prices are effective immediately as of June 30, 2006. All future orders from Group 1 and Group 4 will be processed at the enclosed prices.

Enclosed are reports indicating metal values from April 22, 2005 and May 4, 2006. The increase is over 50%. Steel prices have continued to rise in parallel. Due to this continuation of rising cost, we must exercise this clause. We appreciate the opportunity to continue doing business with Seminole County.

Thank you for allowing Vulcan Signs to continue to serve you in your road sign materials needs.

If you should have any questions, please do not hesitate to call us at 1-800-633-6845.

Sincerely,

Matthew Maurin
Sales Manager

Cc:file

"An Employee Owned Company!"

Vulcan Signs



408 East Berry Avenue / P.O. Box 1850 Foley, Alabama / 36536-1850 (251)-943-1541 or 1-800-633-6845

BID #IFB-3086-04/GMG

TO: ATTN: GLORIA GARCIA
SEMINOLE COUNTY, FL

DATE: 6/30/2006

In response to your inquiry we are pleased to quote on furnishing the following:

ITEM	QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
		GROUP - I - HARDWARE		\$0.00
* 1	125	BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES - WHITE	24.14	3,017.50
* 2	125	BASE MOUNT FLEX STAKES - YELLOW	24.14	3,017.50
* 3	125	FLEX STAKE - WHITE	18.58	2,322.50
* 4	125	FLEX STAKE - YELLOW	18.58	2,322.50
5	150	CHEVRON BRACKET - CAB 2	18.60	2,790.00
6	300	TWIST BRACKET - VS-TWIST 9"	5.95	1,785.00
7	1000	UNDERGROUND BRACKET	NO BID	
8	100	CANTILEVER - VS-800 METRO	18.56	1,856.00
9	50	SQUARE BASE	NO BID	
10	50	SQUARE POST - 12' X 2 1/4"	\$ 40.33	5,538.00
11	200	14' - 2.5# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	27.69	18,990.00
12	1000	12' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	18.99	18,990.00
13	100	10' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	15.82	1,582.00
14	200	8' - 2# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	12.66	2,532.00
15	300	6' - 1.12# GALV U-CHANNEL POST	5.97	1,791.00
16	500	REFLECTORS, AMBER 3 1/4"	0.42	210.00
17	1000	REFLECTORS, RED 3 1/4"	0.42	420.00
*		ITEMS 1 & 2 - SAFE HIT #SH148SMA		
*		ITEMS 1 & 2 - SAFE HIT #SH148SMA		
			TOTAL	\$67,164.00

Prices are F.O.B.: DESTINATION

Delivery: STOCK ITEMS 3-5 DAYS ARO, NON STANDARD ITEMS 30 DAYS ARO

Terms: NET 30



408 East Berry Avenue / P.O. Box 1850 Foley, Alabama / 36536-1850 (251)-943-1541 or 1-800-633-6845

TO: ATTN: GLORIA GARCIA
SEMINOLE COUNTY, FL

DATE: 6/30/2006

In response to your inquiry we are pleased to quote on furnishing the following:

Prices are F.O.B.: DESTINATION
Delivery: 30 DAYS ARO
Terms: NET 30

PEONY ONLINE, INC.

AFTERNOON MARKET REPORT

FRI APR 22, 2005

LONDON METAL EXCHANGE (RING CONTRIBUTOR)

Contract (US\$/mt)	Time	Last	+/-	High	Low	Prev Cls	Open	Settle
ALUMINUM (3-mo)	14:05	1865	+9	1871	1863	1836	1868	1865
ALUMINUM (spot)	14:05	1866	+8	1879	1866	1858	1869	1866
N A ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	1670	+2.5	1685	1670	1667.5	1670	1670
N A ALLOY (spot)	14:05	1643.5	+2.5	1655	1643.5	1641	1645	1643.5
AL ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	1675	+10	1685	1675	1665	1680	1675
AL ALLOY (spot)	14:05	1655	+10	1665	1655	1645	1655	1655
COPPER (3-mo)	14:05	3277	+27	3277	3265	3250	3268	3277
COPPER (spot)	14:05	3425.5	+15.5	3425.5	3415	3410	3420	3425.5
LEAD (3-mo)	14:05	945	+2	947	944	943	944	945
LEAD (spot)	14:05	984.5	+4	995	984.5	980.5	995	984.5
NICKEL (3-mo)	14:05	16000	+75	16000	15875	15925	15900	16000
NICKEL (spot)	14:05	16350	+80	16350	16245	16270	16250	16350
TIN (3-mo)	14:05	8150	+25	8150	8100	8125	8125	8150
TIN (spot)	14:05	8189	+24	8190	8130	8165	8170	8189
ZINC (3-mo)	14:05	1307.5	+7.5	1307.5	1303	1300	1307	1307.5
ZINC (spot)	14:05	1290	+10.5	1290	1287	1279.5	1288	1290

Contract (Cents/lb)	Time	Last	+/-	High	Low	Prev Cls	Open	Settle
ALUMINUM (3-mo)	14:05	84.60	+0.41	84.87	84.50	84.19	84.73	84.60
ALUMINUM (spot)	14:05	84.64	+0.36	85.23	84.64	84.28	84.78	84.64
N A ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	75.75	+0.11	76.43	75.75	75.64	75.75	75.75
N A ALLOY (spot)	14:05	74.55	+0.11	75.07	74.55	74.43	74.62	74.55
AL ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	75.98	+0.45	76.43	75.98	75.52	76.20	75.98
AL ALLOY (spot)	14:05	75.07	+0.45	75.52	75.07	74.62	75.07	75.07
COPPER (3-mo)	14:05	148.64	+1.22	148.64	148.10	147.42	148.23	148.64
COPPER (spot)	14:05	155.38	+0.70	155.38	154.90	154.68	155.13	155.38
LEAD (3-mo)	14:05	42.86	+0.09	42.96	42.82	42.77	42.82	42.86
LEAD (spot)	14:05	44.66	+0.18	45.13	44.66	44.47	45.13	44.66
NICKEL (3-mo)	14:05	725.75	+3.40	725.75	720.08	722.35	721.21	725.75
NICKEL (spot)	14:05	741.62	+3.63	741.62	736.86	738.00	737.09	741.62
TIN (3-mo)	14:05	369.68	+1.13	369.68	367.41	368.54	368.54	369.68
TIN (spot)	14:05	371.45	+1.09	371.49	368.77	370.36	370.59	371.45
ZINC (3-mo)	14:05	59.31	+0.34	59.31	59.10	58.97	59.28	59.31
ZINC (spot)	14:05	58.51	+0.48	58.51	58.38	58.04	58.42	58.51

LME STOCKS (04-21-05 CLOSE) (metric ton)

Aluminum	Al Alloy	NA Alloy	Copper	Nickel	Lead	Tin	Zinc
555,650	44,760	114,660	60,675	7,110	33,350	4,855	552,375
-1,675	+40	+620	+5,950	-114	+175	-90	+1,550

COMEX/NYMEX

Contract	Time	Last	+/-	High/Low	Prev Cls	Open	Settle
COPPER Apr'05	13:29	150.20	+0.55	150.70/150.20	149.65	150.70	150.20
COPPER May'05	13:29	148.80	+0.45	149.70/148.60	148.35	148.70	148.80
COPPER Jul'05	13:29	148.40	+0.40	149.20/148.30	148.00	148.40	148.40
ALUMINUM Apr'05	13:30	89.00	+0.50	89.00/ 89.00	88.50	89.00	89.00
ALUMINUM May'05	13:30	89.20	+0.55	89.20/ 89.00	88.65	89.00	89.20
GOLD Jun'05	13:38	435.60	+1.20	437.00/435.10	434.40	435.50	435.60
SILVER May'05	13:36	7.275	+0.058	7.335/ 7.250	7.217	7.260	7.275
PLATINUM Jul'05	13:12	876.00	+2.10	876.00/874.00	873.90	874.00	876.00
PALLADIUM Jun'05	13:10	201.50	+1.60	202.00/200.50	199.90	200.55	201.50

STOCKS: Copper: 32,258 -482

Aluminum: 37,184 (57,330pc)

Gold : 5,987,757 -59,687 Silver : 103,518,702 UNCH.

COPPER SCRAP 04-22-05 PRECIOUS METAL 04-22-05 13:40 DJ 10196 -22 NAS 1945 -17

#1 bare bright 148.50 H&H Gold: 434.60 CURRENCY 13:30 US\$=EURO 0.7662

#1 burnt 142.00 H&H Silver: 7.305 US\$=MEX 11.044 US\$=CAN 1.234

#2 refinery 134.00 Engelhard: Pt 876 Pd 203 US\$=BZ 0.5224 US\$=JY 105.87

METALS CLOSE WEEK ON POSITIVE NOTE POSTING ACROSS-THE-BOARD GAINS

Base metals closed the week on a positive note, posting across-the-board gains, as a slump in the U.S. dollar rekindled non-American interest before the weekend.

After barely sustaining \$3,250/mt support yesterday, three-month copper put significant distance from this area, breaking through initial resistance pegged at \$3,275/mt, and setting a solid foundation toward a nearby recovery of the \$3,300/mt. Comex May copper wallowed in a thin one cent range in today's action, unable to confirm \$1.49/lb after upside momentum fizzled out at \$1.497/lb.

Thin volumes also hindered three-month nickel from making a sustained move toward forging beyond \$16,000/mt, but the technically favorable close at this level is a good starting point for next week's activity.

In aluminum, three-month metal failed in its bid to cleanly break \$1,075/mt, leaving the market vulnerable to light profit-taking and completely eliminating any hopes of obtaining the \$1,900/mt mark in the near term.

Elsewhere, narrow ranges continue to dominate tin, while similar trading conditions kept lead from regaining \$950/mt.

Copyright © Peony Online, Inc., 2005, All rights Reserved.

PEONY ONLINE, INC.

AFTERNOON MARKET REPORT

THU MAY 04, 2006

LONDON METAL EXCHANGE (RING CONTRIBUTOR)									
Contract (US\$/mt)	Time	Last	+/-	High	Low	Prev	Cls	Open	Settle
ALUMINUM (3-mo)	14:05	2875	+127	2875	2770	2748	2770	2770	2875
ALUMINUM (spot)	14:05	2854.5	+128	2854.5	2753	2726.5	2753	2753	2854.5
N A ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	2565	+100	2570	2470	2465	2470	2470	2565
N A ALLOY (spot)	14:05	2528	+101.5	2530	2422	2426.5	2422	2422	2528
AL ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	2630	+60	2635	2570	2570	2570	2570	2630
AL ALLOY (spot)	14:05	2604	+61	2610	2535	2543	2535	2535	2604
COPPER (3-mo)	14:05	7650	+540	7650	7370	7110	7370	7370	7650
COPPER (spot)	14:05	7776	+552	7776	7555	7224	7555	7555	7776
LEAD (3-mo)	14:05	1238	+43	1241	1205	1195	1210	1210	1238
LEAD (spot)	14:05	1209	+44	1212	1175	1165	1175	1175	1209
NICKEL (3-mo)	14:05	19600	+505	19800	19275	19095	19275	19275	19600
NICKEL (spot)	14:05	19680	+575	19810	19490	19105	19500	19500	19680
TIN (3-mo)	14:05	9375	+125	9450	9375	9250	9450	9450	9375
TIN (spot)	14:05	9307	+129	9400	9307	9178	9400	9400	9307
ZINC (3-mo)	14:05	3440	+220	3445	3321	3220	3350	3350	3440
ZINC (spot)	14:05	3466.5	+223	3466.5	3365	3243.5	3365	3365	3466.5
PPD (Jun)	14:05	1180	+25	1180	1150	1155	1150	1150	1180
LLD (Jun)	14:05	1265	+20	1265	1237.5	1245	1237.5	1237.5	1265
Contract (Cents/lb)	Time	Last	+/-	High	Low	Prev	Cls	Open	Settle
ALUMINUM (3-mo)	14:05	130.41	+5.76	130.41	125.65	124.65	125.65	125.65	130.41
ALUMINUM (spot)	14:05	129.48	+5.81	129.48	124.87	123.67	124.87	124.87	129.48
N A ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	116.35	+4.54	116.57	112.04	111.81	112.04	112.04	116.35
N A ALLOY (spot)	14:05	114.67	+4.60	114.76	109.86	110.06	109.86	109.86	114.67
AL ALLOY (3-mo)	14:05	119.29	+2.72	119.52	116.57	116.57	116.57	116.57	119.29
AL ALLOY (spot)	14:05	118.12	+2.77	118.39	114.99	115.35	114.99	114.99	118.12
COPPER (3-mo)	14:05	347.00	+24.49	347.00	334.30	322.50	334.30	334.30	347.00
COPPER (spot)	14:05	352.71	+25.04	352.71	342.69	327.68	342.69	342.69	352.71
LEAD (3-mo)	14:05	56.15	+1.95	56.29	54.66	54.20	54.88	54.88	56.15
LEAD (spot)	14:05	54.84	+2.00	54.98	53.30	52.84	53.30	53.30	54.84
NICKEL (3-mo)	14:05	889.04	+22.91	898.11	874.30	866.14	874.30	874.30	889.04
NICKEL (spot)	14:05	892.67	+26.08	898.57	884.05	866.59	884.51	884.51	892.67
TIN (3-mo)	14:05	425.24	+5.67	428.65	425.24	419.57	428.65	428.65	425.24
TIN (spot)	14:05	422.16	+5.85	426.38	422.16	416.31	426.38	426.38	422.16
ZINC (3-mo)	14:05	156.04	+9.98	156.26	150.64	146.06	151.95	151.95	156.04
ZINC (spot)	14:05	157.24	+10.12	157.24	152.63	147.12	152.63	152.63	157.24
PPD (Jun)	14:05	53.52	+1.13	53.52	52.16	52.39	52.16	52.16	53.52
LLD (Jun)	14:05	57.38	+0.91	57.38	56.13	56.47	56.13	56.13	57.38

LME STOCKS (05-03-06 CLOSE) (metric ton)

Aluminum	Al Alloy	NA Alloy	Copper	Nickel	Lead	Tin	Zinc
751,600	33,760	125,080	115,975	25,854	99,150	13,705	257,600
+13,300	-120	-120	-175	-912	-500	-110	-750

COMEX/NYMEX

Contract	Time	Last	+/-	High/Low	Prev	Cls	Open	Settle
COPPER May '06	13:38	359.30	+16.80	362.00/349.50	342.50	350.00	359.30	359.30
COPPER Jul '06	13:38	347.95	+17.45	350.50/338.00	330.50	338.00	347.95	347.95
COPPER Sep '06	13:38	342.75	+16.55	345.50/334.00	326.20	334.00	342.75	342.75
ALUMINUM May '06	13:31	131.55	+4.55	131.55/131.55	127.00	131.55	131.55	131.55
ALUMINUM Jul '06	13:31	131.75	+4.55	131.75/131.75	127.20	131.75	131.75	131.75
GOLD Jun '06	13:44	676.50	+8.00	679.80/665.00	668.50	665.00	676.50	676.50
SILVER Jul '06	13:45	13.825	+0.030	14.230/13.560	13.795	13.720	13.825	13.825
PLATINUM Jul '06	13:13	1176.40	-10.30	1189.80/1174.0	1186.70	1175.00	1176.40	1176.40
PALLADIUM Jun '06	13:12	380.25	-2.10	385.80/373.00	382.35	377.00	380.25	380.25

STOCKS: Copper: 15,779 -539 Aluminum: 44,468 (149,009pc)

Gold: 7,334,350 UNCH. Silver: 123,627,373 UNCH.

COPPER SCRAP 05-04-06 PRECIOUS METAL 05-04-06 13:40 DJ 11448 +47 NAS 2323 +19

#1 bare bright 338.00 H&H Gold: 673.50 CURRENCY 13:30 US\$=EURO 0.7883

#1 burnt 333.00 H&H Silver: 13.840 US\$=JPY 10.977 US\$=CAN 1.108

#2 refinery 313.00 Engelhard: Pt 1178 Pd 379 US\$=BE 0.5409 US\$=JY 113.63

COPPER HITS NEW RECORD HIGHS IN LEADING METALS TO HIGHER GROUND

Paving the way for complex-wide gains, a massive resurgence of fund activity in copper saw prices skyrocket to fresh record highs, with LME three-month metal rising by \$540/mt and Comex July copper climbing well over 17 cents. Bullish news by BHP Billiton that they do not expect copper mines to meet surging demand by early 2008, paired with overall current fundamental strength, helped trigger the flood of technical buying.

Nickel reached as high as \$19,900/mt, a 4.2% jump for the day, before light profit-taking emerged. A solid 912 metric ton LME stock draw and ongoing bright prospects for stainless steel demand in 2006 assisted in the upward climb.

Aluminum prices hit near-18-year highs, but fell short of \$2,900/mt. Zinc rose \$220/mt, and peaked at a fresh all-time high before paring gains.

Copyright © Peony Online, Inc., 2006, All rights Reserved.